
ANNUAL EQUIPMENT RENTAL CONTRACT - BID OPENING: SEPTEMBER 21, 2010

VENDOR:  RANSOME RENTS EAGLE POWER & EQUIPMENT CO. HERTZ EQUIPMENT RENTAL PLASTERER EQUIPMENT
BENSALEM, PA MONTGOMERYVILLE, PA PENNSAUKEN NJ SELLERSVILLE PA 18960

ITEM # DESCRIPTION DAILY WEEKLY MONTHLY DAILY WEEKLY MONTHLY DAILY WEEKLY MONTHLY DAILY WEEKLY MONTHLY

1 RIDE ON VIBRATORY
ROLLER $155.00 $495.00 $1,300.00 $168.00 $552.00 $1,520.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 660.00$     998.00$     1,755.00$     

Caterpillar CB-22 Sakai SW320

2 LOADER BACKHOE $270.00 $720.00 $1,980.00 $252.00 $784.00 $2,352.00 $200.00 $477.00 $1,538.00 700.00$     1,140.00$  2,400.00$     
Caterpillar 416E Extendahoe John Deere 410J

3 LOADER BACKHOE
W/HYDRAULIC HAMMER $495.00 $1,230.00 $3,960.00 $456.00 $1,628.00 $4,224.00 $257.00 $661.00 $2,025.00 925.00$     1,750.00$  3,980.00$     

Caterpillar 416 w/H90 Hammer John Deere 310SJ

4 RUBBER TIRE
WHEEL LOADER $1,410.00 $1,280.00 $4,110.00 $336.00 $1,012.00 $2,992.00 $354.00 $928.00 $2,870.00 870.00$     1,600.00$  3,500.00$     

Caterpillar 928 John Deere 644J

5 HYDRAULIC 
EXCAVATION $990.00 $2,970.00 $8,820.00 $816.00 $2,200.00 $6,600.00 718.00$   2,101.00$  7,073.00$  2,100.00$  3,650.00$  8,795.00$     

Caterpillar 336 John Deer 350D

6 10 Wheel Dump Truck no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 398.00$   1,435.00$  3,075.00$  NO BID NO BID NO BID

7 Hauling Rate per Hour $75.00 $75.00 $75.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 40.00$     40.00$       40.00$       included in unit pricing

Percentage Increase of 2nd Year of Contra 3.5% 0% US Communties Pricing 0%

Percentage Increase of 3rd Year of Contrac 3.5% 0% 0%


